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Fund Facts 

Fund type Property securities fund  

Commencement date 1 April 2020 

Fund size $23.40 
as at 31 December 2024 

Investment timeframe  5-7 years 

Minimum investment $1000 

Minimum additional amount $500  
($100 per month with regular savings plan) 

Income distribution Monthly 
generally payable within 10 business days3 

Current Running Yield 3.80%4 

Unit pricing Daily  

Management fees and costs 0.98% pa of NAV 
(see section 6 of the PDS for details) 

Buy/sell spread  0.15% buy and 0.15% sell 

 
Performance – Dexus Global REIT Fund 

 3 months 
% 

6 months 
% 

1 year 
% 

3 years 
%(pa) 

Since  
inception %(pa) 

DXGRF total return (after fees)5  3.15 16.10 14.46 1.77 9.24 

GPR 250 REIT Index (AU) total return 1.37 13.68 12.72 0.22 8.55 

+/(-) 1.78 2.42 1.74 1.55 0.69 

 

1. GPR 250 REIT Index (AUD) Yield 

2. The Dexus Global REIT Fund aims to provide lower than market volatility compared with the GPR 250 REIT Index (AUD) over a 5-7 year time horizon 

3. Past performance is not an indicator of future performance. 

4. Current running yield as at 31st December 2024 is calculated daily by dividing the annualised distribution rate by the latest entry unit price. Distributions may include a 
capital gains component. Distributions are not guaranteed and past performance is not an indication of future performance. 

5. Returns after all fees and expenses. Assumes distributions are reinvested. Investors’ tax rates are not taken into account when calculating returns. Returns and values 
may rise and fall from one period to another. Past performance is not an indicator of future performance. Fund’s inception date used to determine return: 1 April 2020. 

 
 

 

  

Investment Objective  

The primary investment return objectives of the Fund are to: 

─ Deliver a gross annual income yield (before management 
fees, expenses and taxes) in excess of the Fund’s 
performance benchmark1, combined with some capital 
growth, derived predominantly from investing in global 
REITs 

─ Maintain the real value of investments over a 5-7 year time 
horizon (where real value is measured against the 
weighted-average CPI for those countries within the GPR 
250 REIT Index (AU) Yield (or equivalent) 

─ Provide lower than market volatility2 

Benefits 

─ Focus on generating sustainable, regular and relatively 
high income returns through investing in listed property 
securities 

─ Access to an underlying diversified portfolio of thousands 
of quality commercial real estate assets predominantly 
located in North America, Asia Pacific and European 
markets  

─ Has paid monthly distributions3 

─ Actively managed (non-index aware) portfolio, applying a 
highly disciplined and proven strategy designed to deliver 
on the Fund’s income and risk objectives 

─ Liquid – daily applications and withdrawals (under normal 
market conditions but withdrawals can take longer in 
certain cases as set out in the PDS) 

 

 

 
 



 

 

7. Returns after all fees and expenses. Assumes distributions are reinvested. Investors’ tax rates are not taken into account when calculating returns. Returns and values 
may rise and fall from one period to another. Past performance is not an indicator of future performance. Fund’s inception date used to determine return: 1 April 2020 

8. Past performance is not an indicator of future performance. 

 
 

Fund Commentary 

The Dexus Global REIT Fund (the Fund) returned 3.15%7 

over the quarter, which was 178bps ahead of the return of 
its benchmark.  

At a regional level, the largest positive contributor to the 
Fund’s relative performance was superior stock selection 
in North America. This was most evident amongst 
Canadian REITs where the Fund outperformed the 
benchmark by 988bps, mostly due to its overweight to the 
senior housing sector. 

At a sub-sector level, the Fund’s overweight exposure to 
select Datacentre and Healthcare REITs contributed to 
positive performance. This was most pronounced in US 
hyperscale datacentres, medical office buildings and 
seniors housing. relatively lower allocation to Retail and 
Single-family REITs, however, detracted from performance 
through the period. 

At a stock level, the largest contributor to the Fund’s 
relative performance through the quarter was an 
overweight position in Retail Opportunities Investment 
Corporation (NYSE:ROIC), a specialised owner and 
manager of grocery-anchored shopping centres located 
within densely populated metropolitan areas across the 
West Coast of the United States. Blackstone announced in 
November its definitive agreement to acquire ROIC for a 
34% premium to the share price prior to news of a potential 
sale being made public. CTO Realty Growth Inc 
(NYSE:CTO) was another top performing Retail REIT held 
by the fund. Its portfolio comprises grocery anchored and 
lifestyle retail shopping centres located in the US sunbelt. 
We continue to like select high quality Retail REITs given 
the lack of new supply and resilient demand for essential 
items.  

The largest detractor to the Fund’s relative performance 
through the quarter was an underweight position in Simon 
Property Group (NYSE:SPG), a specialist owner and 
manager of retail malls and outlet centres across the US. 
We have actively limited the Fund’s exposure to 
discretionary retail landlords, given the outlook for 
discretionary spending. We have instead allocated to those 
portfolios providing access to non-discretionary items 
where retailer sales are likely to prove more resilient. 

As relative-value investors looking for growth at a 
reasonable price, our investment preference remains for 
REITs with resilient, growing income streams and solid 
capital structures. Pleasingly, select REITs sharing these 
attributes currently appear miss-priced by the public 
market.  

Despite recent strong relative performance, in our view 
select global REITs continue to offer attractive long-term 
total return prospects and we will continue to focus the 
Fund’s exposure to these opportunities. 

Market Commentary8  

Global REITs (GPR 250 REIT Index (AU)) returned 1.37% 
through the December quarter, underperforming global 
equities (MSCI World Index (AU) which returned 12.11%. 
Country level performance was driven by the United States 
(4.13%) while, Australia (-7.69%), Belgium (-13.02%), 
Canada (-10.65%) and the United Kingdom (-11.80%) 
lagged.  

At a sub-sector level Datacentre REITs (20.5%) performed 
the strongest driven by demand for AI capacity. Consumer 
adoption of AI tools is accelerating in fields like coding, 
graphic design, pharmaceuticals, robotics, & education 
which all require more compute power. Overall vacancy 
remains below 2% with most new supply pre-leased to 
hyperscale users on long-term leases. 

At a high level, Global REIT sector performance continues 
to be driven largely by inflation expectations and the 
ensuing pathway for interest rates. Inflationary forces have 
proven to be sticky in developed economies including 
Australia but are decelerating globally into the 2-3% range. 
Throughout the quarter, however, the sector reacted 
negatively to the US federal reserve's slower than 
expected pace of interest rate cuts despite more 
aggressive cutting observed in Canada, the United 
Kingdom and the Eurozone. 

The last of the major developed-economy election 
processes for 2024 took place in the US and resulted in 
the re-election of Donald Trump as President. While policy 
uncertainty exists, this result is expected to boost the 
reshoring of US manufacturing and rapid AI development, 
potentially benefiting industrial and datacentre demand. 
Substantial tariffs and deportations, if they eventuate, 
would likely lead to cost increases in construction 
dampening supply growth for most sectors. 

Our analysis of Global REIT sector performance suggests 
that on balance tenant demand is robust, market rental 
levels are either stable or growing and there is further 
support for top-line revenue growth as annual rent 
indexation progresses through existing leases. Implications 
of the difficult development financing and construction cost 
environment has also led to a general lack of built-form 
supply which should bode well for incumbent landlords. 
This set-up suggests select well capitalised and managed 
REITs are positioned to deliver strong returns, in our view. 

In our view, performance from here will be led by select 
Global REITs which have been able to manage their 
balance sheets well and enjoy the flexibility to actively 
deploy capital into the next cyclical upswing. As an active 
manager, we are currently looking to capitalise on these 
opportunities as we actively manage the portfolio. 

 



 

  

Global Team 

 

Mark Mazzarella, CFA 

Mark joined Dexus Real Estate Securities (formerly APN Real Estate Securities) team in 2014 and is responsible for the analysis 

and funds management of the Australian, Global and Asian REIT Funds. 

Prior to joining Dexus, Mark worked for Ernst & Young as a Senior Consultant and was responsible for real estate market research, 

property valuation, project feasibility studies, scenario analysis, financial modelling for real estate investments, transaction due 

diligence and bespoke advisory engagements. Mark was accepted into the New Horizons Program which resulted in a six-month 

secondment to the Ernst & Young corporate finance team in Singapore. 

Mark holds a Bachelor of Commerce (Finance) and a Bachelor of Property and Construction (Property) from the University of 

Melbourne. He is an Associate of the Australian Property Institute, a Certified Practicing Valuer and a CFA. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

David Kruth, CFA 

David joined Dexus Real Estate Securities in 2019 as Regional Adviser, with more than 30 years experience across North American 

and global real estate markets. 

He worked for 15 years as CIO, Portfolio Manager and Securities Analyst in global real estate securities with both Alliance Bernstein 

(AB) and Goldman Sachs Asset Management. David also worked for 13 years in global private equity real estate with Schroder 

Real Estate Associates and the Yarmouth Group (Lend Lease Real Estate Investments). He served on the Board of Directors at 

Rouse Properties (NYSE:RSE) from 2011 to 2016 and chaired the special committee tasked with the sale of Rouse to Brookfield 

Asset Management. 

He is Adjunct Assistant Professor at the Columbia University Masters Program in Real Estate Development & Investment and a 

member of the Investment Advisory Counsel at the Ithaca College School of Business. 

www.dexus.com 

This document (“Material”) has been prepared by Dexus Asset Management Limited (ACN 080 674 479, AFSL No. 237500) (“DXAM”), the responsible entity and 

issuer of the financial products of the Dexus Global REIT Fund (ARSN 642 411 292) mentioned in this Material. DXAM is a wholly owned subsidiary of Dexus (ASX: 

DXS). 

Information in this Material is current as at 31 December 2024 (unless otherwise indicated), is for general information purposes only, (subject to applicable law) 

does not constitute financial product advice, has been prepared without taking account of the recipient’s objectives, financial situation and needs, and does not 

purport to contain all information necessary for making an investment decision. Accordingly, and before you receive any financial service from us (including deciding 

to acquire or to continue to hold a product in any fund mentioned in this Material), or act on this Material, investors should obtain and consider the relevant product 

disclosure statement (“PDS”), DXAM financial services guide (“FSG”) and relevant target market determination (“TMD”) in full, consider the appropriateness of this 

Material having regard to your own objectives, financial situation and needs and seek independent legal, tax and financial advice. The PDS, FSG and TMD (hard 

copy or electronic copy) are available from DXAM, Level 5, 80 Collins Street (South Tower), Melbourne VIC 3000, by visiting https://www.dexus.com/investor-centre, 

by emailing investorservices@dexus.com or by phoning 1300 374029. The PDS contains important information about risks, costs and fees (including fees payable 

to DXAM for managing the fund). Any investment is subject to investment risk, including possible delays in repayment and loss of income and principal invested, 

and there is no guarantee on the performance of the fund or the return of any capital. This Material does not constitute an offer, invitation, solicitation or 

recommendation to subscribe for, purchase or sell any financial product, and does not form the basis of any contract or commitment. This Material must not be 

reproduced or used by any person without DXAM’s prior written consent. This Material is not intended for distribution or use in any jurisdiction where it would be 

contrary to applicable laws, regulations or directives. 

Any forward looking statements, opinions and estimates (including statements of intent) in this Material are based on estimates and assumptions related to future 

business, economic, market, political, social and other conditions that are inherently subject to significant uncertainties, risks and contingencies, and the assumptions 

may change at any time without notice. Actual results may differ materially from those predicted or implied by any forward looking statements for a range of reasons. 

Past performance is not an indication of future performance. The forward looking statements only speak as at the date of this Material, and except as required by 

law, DXAM disclaims any duty to update them to reflect new developments. 

Except as required by law, no representation, assurance, guarantee or warranty, express or implied, is made as to the fairness, authenticity, validity, suitability, 

reliability, accuracy, completeness or correctness of any information, statement, estimate or opinion, or as to the reasonableness of any assumption, in this Material. 

By reading or viewing this Material and to the fullest extent permitted by law, the recipient releases Dexus, DXAM, their affiliates, and all of their directors, officers, 

employees, representatives and advisers from any and all direct, indirect and consequential losses, damages, costs, expenses and liabilities of any kind (“Losses”) 

arising in connection with any recipient or person acting on or relying on anything contained in or omitted from this Material or any other written or oral information, 

statement, estimate or opinion, whether or not the Losses arise in connection with any negligence or default of Dexus, DXAM or their affiliates, or otherwise. 

Dexus, DXAM and/or their affiliates may have an interest in the financial products, and may earn fees as a result of transactions, mentioned in this Material. 

http://www.ampcapital.com/

